
GIRLS & GUNS: LFC'S
2025 CALENDAR IS
LOCKED & LOADED

LFC's annual calendar has become a
collector's item our fans look forward to
every year. Each calendar has a different
theme: cars, pets, movies, etc. The theme
for the 2025 calendar is guns and we're
not talking just any guns. Ring girls Queen
& Lana show off some impressive
armament - and even more impressive
bodies - for January. Who better to ring in
the new year than our sexy ring girls?! If
you'd like a free digital copy of the
calendar when it drops right before
Christmas simply sign up at

View in browser

https://dashboard.mailerlite.com/preview/70600/emails/137138977618527991


www.LFCfights.com as all our site
members will get a copy.

JOLENE HEXX HAS
HER EYES ON THE
PRIZE

She's LFC's first ever 3 title champion and
a bonafide fan favorite so it was no easy
decision stripping Jolene 'The Valkyrie'
Hexx of 2 of her 3 titles. But the rules are
clear - defend your titles or lose them. Last
week we had the very good fortune to
shoot with Jolene for the 2025 calendar
and she confirmed her plans to return next
season. And it will come as no surprise
that she has already set her sights on
winning back both the Booty Camp and
LFC titles. See all of Jolene's uncensored
fights exclusively at www.LFCfights.com



LFC's SOCIAL MEDIA
CONTINUES TO CLIMB

Last week LFC's popular YouTube channel
became more popular still, surpassing
750K subscribers. The most commented
on videos? Anything featuring our newest
referee, Lela Bellinger. And after losing our
FaceBook page to a hacker, we launched
a new one on October 1. As of today the
new page already has 83K followers.
Follow us at
https://www.facebook.com/LingerieFighting
Official

https://www.facebook.com/LingerieFightingOfficial
https://www.facebook.com/LingerieFightingOfficial


SAMIHA GLAM
RETURNS TO THE LFC
PODCAST

Earlier this season, Samiha 'The Goddess'
Glam returned to LFC after an absence of
nearly 10 years. Fighting at both LFC40:
Booty Camp 5 and LFC41: Lingerie Fight
Club, Glam showed no rust in matches
against Courtney Pemberton and Koven.
Now Glam returns to the LFC podcast to
recap both fights with host Michael Larkin.
See the episode exclusively at
www.LFCfights.com
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